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Focus Area  

 
Continuum of Care Data 
Structure 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Continuum of Care Members 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Current Status 

 
Homeless Management 
Information System (HMIS) 
Contract with Apricot 
 
Working on Coordinated Entry 
System (CES) access structure and 
hiring a CES lead for by-name-list. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Membership growing  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Target for Future Status 

 
HMIS is operational and LCCoC 
funded projects are entering 
client data within 3 working days. 
 
All HMIS users are conducting 
Housing Problem Solving 
interviews as the first step to the 
Coordinated Entry System 
 
Projects include Housing First 
Principles 
 
Through CES most vulnerable are 
housed and prioritization is 
established 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Members engaged in committees  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Action Plan                           

 
The Coordinated Entry System 
(CES) Committee will provide 
training on Housing Problem 
Solving Interview Process 
 
CES Committee will provide a 
training on Housing First 
Principles and Compliance 
Review 
 
LCCoC hires CES Lead to 
Manage data and by-name-list, 
 
CES Committee will incorporate 
all HUD requirements, including 
Program Standards for Shelters, 
Rapid Rehousing, Transitional 
Housing and Permanent Housing 
 
 
 
Recruit versatile membership 
 
Continue to invite members to 
join committees at General 
Membership meetings 
  
Offer annual training on cultural 
awareness and sensitivity  
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Continuum of Care  
Communications 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Housing solutions for client 
population groups – 
The Lake County Continuum of 
Care, this past year, supported 
the establishment of shelter beds 
in the North and South Shore 
areas of Lake County. The LCCoC 
Plan emphasized projects 
creating beds for residents. 
Two hundred and twelve 
residents were provided a 
program with a bed from July 1, 
2020, to June 30, 2021. Residents 
may be counted in more than 
one population group. 
 
 
 
 
 

 
Communication through Website 
and General Membership 
monthly meetings 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Families with Children – 
Department Social Services 
CalWORKS Permanent Housing 
Program (PHA) and Housing 
Support Program (HSP), Rapid 
Rehousing Programs (North Coast 
Opportunities NCO New Digs, 
Hope Center and Elijah House), 
Tribal Housing Programs, 
Redwood Community Services 
Nest Program, HOME Program, 
and TULE House, Catholic 
Charities COVID assistance, Lake 
Family Resource Center (LFRC) 
domestic violence shelter and 
nine Subsidized Apartment 
Complexes. 
From July 1, 2020 to June 30, 
2021 Ten Children were identified 

 
The Lake County Community is 
aware of what the Lake County 
Continuum of Care offers Lake 
County 
 
Continuous outreach and current 
event announcements on 
programs are available to the at-
risk and homeless members of 
our community.  
 
 
 
Additional low-income housing is 
built and made available for 
families 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
Community awareness with 
public webinar and encourage 
use of our Facebook and web site  
 
Develop webinar materials for 
educating the community, 
government entities, and service 
agencies about the LCCoC 
 
 
 
 
 
LCCoC Advocacy at County 
Government Level for additional 
Rural Housing Development 
Programs 
 
LCCoC Financial Support for Rapid 
Rehousing Projects  
 
PIT count to identify need (Jan) 
and prioritization for services in 
annual community survey (fall) 
 
LCCoC Continued support for 
Navigation services 
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in HMIS as receiving a program 
with a bed 
 
 
Unaccompanied Youth – Services 
only - Lake County Office of 
Education (LCOE) Healthy Start 
Program, all school districts 
McKinney-Vento Liaisons.  and 
RCS Harbor 
 
 
 
 
 
Transition Aged Youth (TAY) 
Housing 
Hope Center and Elijah House 
emergency shelters accept 18+ 
year-old residents, the Nest 
accepts 18-25 pregnant or 
parenting residents, the HOME 
Sober Living Environment (SLE) 
services, Scotts Valley Safe House 
DV and SLE shelters TAY 18+ and 
the Harbor offers services. 
Eight Transitional Aged Youth 
were identified in HMIS as 
receiving a program with a bed 
 
 
 
Senior Residents - Senior 
subsidized apartments- two for 

 
 
 
 
Unaccompanied youth home 
serving youth 13 to 18 years old 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Establish Transitional Age Youth 
Home in Lake County for 18–24-
year-old age group 
 
College dormitory housing 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Additional senior subsidized 
housing is built  

 
 
 
 
Coordinate with McKinney-Vento 
school district liaisons for 
identifying youth (October and 
May) 
 
PIT count to identify need (Jan) 
and prioritization for services in 
annual community survey (fall) 
 
 
 
PIT count to identify need (Jan) 
and prioritization for services in 
annual community survey (fall) 
 
LCCoC support, with identifying 
and advocating for funding to 
establish transitional home 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
PIT count to identify need (Jan) 
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55+ and 10 apartment complexes 
for age 62+, senior centers offer 
services.  
Thirty-five Aged 62+ received a 
bed 
 
 
 
Veterans – VA services: Contract 
Residential Housing, Residential 
Rehab and Treatment Programs, 
and HUD Veterans Affairs 
Supportive Housing (HUD-VASH)  
Elijah House and Hope Center 
offer shelter and services are 
offered through VA for locating 
benefits and health care  
Three certified Veterans and 
seven not chronically homeless 
were identified in HMIS as 
receiving a program with a bed 
 
 
 
Disabled Residents– Redwood 
Regional Center Homes and 
People Services Inc, Konocti 
Connections, and disabled are 
eligible for subsidized housing. 
Sixty-nine identified in HMIS with 
a physical disability and twenty-
one residents were identified 
with a developmental disability 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Transitional Housing is built for 
Veterans 
 
Funding is made available in Lake 
County for VA Housing 
 
Automatic referrals through CES 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Housing Programs designed 
specifically for at risk of or 
unhoused disabled residents 
 
Additional Housing Units with 
services to maintain housing 
 
 
 
 

 and prioritization for services in 
annual community survey (fall) 
 
LCCoC support, with identifying 
and advocating for funding 
 
 
 
PIT count to identify need (Jan) 
and prioritization for services in 
annual community survey (fall) 
 
Local access points refer to VA 
Nations Finest and County 
Veterans Service Office 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
PIT count to identify need (Jan) 
and prioritization for services in 
annual community survey (fall) 
 
LCCoC support, with identifying 
and advocating for funding 
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Medical Fragile Residents – 
Adventist Health Restoration 
House.  
Sixty-two were identified with a 
chronic health condition and 
received a program with a bed 
 
 
 
Behavioral Health Housing – 
Lake County Behavioral Health  
Services (LCBHS) assists with 
residential housing, Bevins Court 
Apartments, and services at 
Community Peer Support 
Centers. 
One hundred-eight were 
identified with a mental health 
disability and received a program 
with a bed 
 
 
 
Substance Abuse Housing – 
Lake County Behavioral Health 
Services funds Hilltop Recovery 
Residential Program and supports 
additional programs, RCS TULE 
House and the HOME SLE 
program, and Lake County Tribal 
Health offers services. 
Seventeen were identified with 
an alcohol use disability, fifty-five 

 
Additional Housing Units with 
services to restore health and 
find permanent housing 
 
Shared Housing for continued 
medical support 
 
 
 
Additional Housing Units for 
residents with mental health 
disabilities, with comprehensive 
services 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Support residents in recovery 
with clean affordable and 
available housing options 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
PIT count to identify need (Jan) 
and prioritization for services in 
annual community survey (fall) 
 
LCCoC support, with identifying 
and advocating for funding 
  
 
 
PIT count to identify need (Jan) 
and prioritization for services in 
annual community survey (fall) 
 
LCCoC support, with identifying 
and advocating for funding 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
PIT count to identify need (Jan) 
and prioritization for services in 
annual community survey (fall) 
 
LCCoC support, with identifying 
and advocating for funding 
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were identified with a drug use 
disability and twenty-six were 
identified having a substance use 
disability with both and receiving 
a program with a bed 
 
 
 
Domestic Violence – Lake Family 
Resource Center Domestic 
Violence shelter and Scotts Valley 
Tribe Safe House Shelter. 
Thirty-five Residents received a 
bed  
 
 
 
Residents Hard to House due to 
Barriers – Justice System 
Involvement, Past Eviction 
History, No Credit History, 
Generational Homeless, People 
with Pets and Intellectually 
Incapable to Maintain Housing 
 
 
Eighty-one Unhoused Residents 
received a bed 
 
 
Unhoused Camping/Cars 
Unhoused on the Street- 
outreach services through 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
All DV victims have available 
shelter and/or housing 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Housing Units with agency rental 
oversight (Agency or government 
acting as landlord) with case 
management services 
 
Housing units with all-in -one 
rental payment which includes all 
utilities and trash service 
 
Home Key projects established 
 
 
 
Safe parking areas established 
with sanitation and trash services 
 
Home Key Housing  

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
PIT count to identify need (Jan) 
and prioritization for services in 
annual community survey (fall) 
 
LCCoC support, with identifying 
and advocating for funding 
 
 
 
PIT count to identify need (Jan) 
and prioritization for services in 
annual community survey (fall) 
 
LCCoC support, with identifying 
and advocating for funding 
 
LCCoC continued support for 
Navigation services 
 
 
 
 
LCCoC street outreach grant 
funding 
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warming Hands and Sunrise 
Services  
 
 
 
 
 
 
Racial Diversity - 
Of the two hundred-twelve 
program beds provided 
One hundred-seventy-nine went 
to residents who identified as 
White, nine were provided for 
those who identified as Black, 
one as Asian, twelve for Native, 
ten identified as Multiple Race 
and one client did not know or 
choose to identify. 
Sunrise Services offers referrals 
and supports  
BIPOC – Black, Indigenous and 
People of Color – Thirty-three 
residents received a program 
with a bed 
  
Twenty -four who identified 
Hispanic Ethnicity received a bed 
 
 
 
Native Residents - The seven 
tribal nations in Lake County offer 
housing support to tribal 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Culturally inclusive programs 
advocate for housing and services 
with the LCCoC   
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
All Tribal members are referred 
to Tribal Housing Programs 
 

Law Enforcement and county 
government working with the 
LCCoC – helping with solutions 
for residents who choose to 
remain unhoused 
 
 
 
PIT count to identify need (Jan) 
and prioritization for services in 
annual community survey (fall) 
 
LCCoC includes cultural diversity 
expectations in all funded 
projects 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
PIT count to identify need (Jan) 
and prioritization for services in 
annual community survey (fall) 
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Long Term Plans 

members, Sunrise Services offers 
support services through mobile 
encampment outreach. 
Twelve Native Residents received 
a bed (also included in BIPOC 
count) 
 
 
 
Migrant Seasonal and Farm 
Workers – EDD has staff for the 
Migrant Seasonal and Farm 
Workers (MSFW) Outreach 
Program, from the Federal 
Monitor Advocate Offices. 
Kelseyville Unified School District 
offers Migrant Education Program 
services. 
 
 
 
 
LGBTQ – Lesbian, Gay, Bisexual 
and Transgender Community 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Limited Funding 
 
 

Scotts Valley Sugarbowl Home 
Key complex  
 
Additional Tribal housing is built 
 
 
 
 
 
Referrals are made to Maria 
Preciado, EDD MSFW Outreach 
Advocate  
 
All Migrant Farmworkers are 
referred to Migrant Farmworker 
housing (USDA Rural 
Communities Housing) or other 
housing in Lake County 
 
 
 
 
LGBTQ resident housing and 
services in Lake County 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
HUD Compliance and receiving 
more housing dollars 
 

 
LCCoC support, with identifying 
and advocating for funding, and 
funding housing when funds are 
available 
 
 
 
 
LCCoC support, with identifying 
and advocating for funding 
 
LCCoC will work with the MSFW 
Federal Monitor Advocates local 
outreach worker for Migrant 
Seasonal and Farm Workers 
numbers of homeless 
 
 
 
 
 
PIT count to identify need (Jan) 
and prioritization for services in 
annual community survey (fall) 
 
LCCoC support, with identifying 
and advocating for funding 
 
 
 
LCCoC will complete CES process 
and work on performance review 
measures 
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 LCCoC funds permanent housing 
programs and safe parking  
locations. 
 
 
 

Make connections with local 
government planning 
departments for long-term 
solutions  
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